RESOLUTION NO. 71-10-18
A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN COMMISSION OF THE
TOWN OF LAKE PARK, FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE
PURCHASE OF SURVEILLANCE CAMERAS AND RELATED
EQUIPMENT AND SERVICES; AND AUTHORIZING THE
TOWN MANAGER TO EXECUTE ALL DOCUMENTS
NEEDED TO EFFECTUATE SUCH PURCHASES; AND
PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.
WHEREAS, the Town of Lake Park, Florida (“Town”) is a municipal corporation of the
State of Florida with such power and authority as has been conferred upon it by the Florida
Constitution and Chapter 166, Florida Statutes; and
WHEREAS, the Town is empowered to enter into contractual arrangements with public
agencies, private corporations or other persons; and
WHEREAS, the Town Commission has determined that there is a need for surveillance
cameras and related equipment to further the public’s health, safety, and welfare; and
WHEREAS, the Town solicited from vendors via an Invitation-to-Bid (ITB) for the
procurement of all necessary surveillance equipment and services; and
WHEREAS, the Town received three bids from vendors on September 18, 2018 to provide
such equipment and services; and
WHEREAS, the Town determined that the lowest responsible and responsive bid was
from E.I. Computer Systems, Inc., DBA Continental Computers / WLANmall (the Vendor) in an
amount of $56,851.11; and
WHEREAS, in its bid submittal, the Vendor represented that it is qualified, able and

willing to satisfactorily provide the products solicited in the Town’s ITB; and



WHEREAS, upon receipt of the equipment by the Town from the Vendor, the Palm Beach
County Sheriff’s Office will provide the services necessary for the installation of the equipment;
and

WHEREAS, during the course of installation, ancillary items and electrical services will
be required from third parties (“Ancillary Costs”); and

WHEREAS, the estimated amount of these Ancillary Costs is $6,930.00; and

WHEREAS, the total project cost (equipment and Ancillary Costs) is $63,781.11; and

WHEREAS, the Town has budgeted funds in its current fiscal year budget which are
available to fund the total project cost; and

WHEREAS, Town Manager has recommended to the Town Commission that it is in the
best interest of the Town to implement this surveillance camera program, and to procure all
necessary products and services needed for implementation.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COMMISSION OF THE
TOWN OF LAKE PARK, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein.

Section 2. The Commission hereby authorizes and directs the Town Manager to
execute all documents necessary to effectuate the purchase of the equipment. A copy of the
vendor’s bid is attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit A.

Section 3. The Commission hereby authorizes and directs the Town Manager to
procure all necessary ancillary items for installation of the surveillance camera program, in
accordance with the Town’s purchasing ordinance. A copy of the summary of these ancillary costs
is attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit B.

Section 4. This Resolution shall take effect upon execution.



The foregoing Resolution was offered by \(,L,c‘,.a mcb-w (j{ j (O~ (_,aJO,Cm

who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by C,c, A’ Oiyfyu.c_,/«_
and upon being put to a roll call vote, the vote was as follows:
AYE NAY
MAYOR MICHAEL O’ROURKE Pl
VICE-MAYOR KIMBERLY GLAS-CASTRO .
COMMISSIONER ERIN FLAHERTY /
COMMISSIONER ANNE LYNCH v
COMMISSIONER ROGER MICHAUD /

The Town Commission thereupon declared the foregoing Resolution NO. ‘z [~10-/ X
duly passed and adopted this /7 day of @ C;ﬁ?/be,/ , 2018.

TOWN OF LAKE PARK, FLORIDA

BY:

MICHAEL O’ROURKE
MAYOR

ATTEST:

o

VIVIAN MENDEZ
TOWN CLERK

OF L'q/'Qo

$(TOWN SBAL)
2 SEAL &

A T iiohas ASL 3T
il TOWN ﬁ

Approved as to form and legal sufficiency:




ExwiniT A

BID FORM
PURCHASE OF SURVEILLANCE CAMERAS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT
ITB No. 109-2018

Instructions: Remove this and all following pages, complete and execute, and submit
in duplicate (2 Originals and 2 copies).

In accordance with the plans and specifications noted in this ITB document, the TOTAL
PROPOSED PRICE for all products solicited is:
Fifty-six Thousand Eight Hundred Fifty-one Dollars and Eleven Cenls ($ 56,851.11 )

Required documents attached? - (2 Originals and 2 copies): (Yes or No)
- Bid Form (signed) Yes
- Price Bid Form Yes
- Addenda Form (Signed) Yes
- Clarifications/Exceptions Form Yos
- Bid Bond (LOC or Cashier’'s Check, 5%
of total proposed price of all products) Yes
- Non Collusion Affidavit Yes
- Sworn Statement on Public Entity Crimes Yes
- Anti-kickback Affidavit Yes

NAME OF FIRM: E.l. Computer Systems, Inc dba Continental Computers / WLANmail

ADDRESS: 920 N Nash St, Building B

El Segundo, CA 90245

PHONE #: 310-416-1200 FAX #; 310-416-1443

E-MAIL: jennie@wlanmall.com

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: % ' 7
NAME & TITLE (TYPED or PRINTEDg// EzlE /5 gl ;':%Z_C/W//E/[& ‘
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PRICE BID FORM

TITLE: PURCHASE OF SURVEILLANCE CAMERAS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT

BID DUE DATE: September 18, 2018; 10:00 a.m. EST

CONTACT PERSON WITH TOWN: Vivian Mendez, TOWN Clerk
Tel. 561-881-3311
Email: vimendez@lakeparkflorida.gov

Please propose prices for the following items:

ITEM UNIT EXTENDED
NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICE PRICE

1 PowF:rEdg.e R740xd (as specified in technical | e $0.650.00
specifications)

9 1?(?01 uSSS-E Camera, High-Speed PTZ with Instant Laser 1 . ST

3 AXIS Electrical Safety Kit A 120VAC, 5503-521 11 $153.23 $1,685.53

4 AXIS T91A57 Pole Mount, 60-400MM 11 $68.53 $753.83

5 AXIS T91L61 Wall-and-Pole Mount 11 $76.23 $838.53

6 AXIS T98A18-VE Surveillance Cabinet, 5900-181 11 $207.13 $2,278.43

7 AXIS Cabinet Lock 11 $45.43 $499.73

8 AXIS Surveillance Card 128GB 11 $79.73 $877.03
Cradlepoint; NetCloud IoT 1yr IBR600C with WiFi §575.10

9 LPE - ATT 11 $6,326.10

10 | XPROTECT CORPORATE DEVICE LICENSE 22 $263.20 $5,790.40

11 | 1 Year Support for XPCODL Device Channel License 22 $48.00 $1,056.00
TOTAL PRICE of ITEMS 1-11 - -4 $56.851.11

Written Amount $_Fifty-six Thousand Eight Hundred Fifty-one Dollars and Eleven Cents

Submitted By: Jennie Gross

Name of Firm: & Compuler Systems, Inc dba Contingntal Computers / WLANmall

Tel. No. _ 310-416-1200

Fax No. 310-416-1443

Email Address: jennie@wlanmall.com
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ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA
INSTRUCTIONS: COMPLETE PART I OR PART II, WHICHEVER APPLIES

PART I:

List below the dates of issue for each addendum received in connection with this Solicitation:

Addendum #1, Dated

Addendum #2, Dated

Addendum #3, Dated

Addendum #4, Dated

Addendum #35, Dated

Addendum #6, Dated

Addendum #7, Dated

Addendum #8, Dated

Addendum #9, Dated

Addendum #10, Dated

PART II:

X NO ADDENDUM WAS RECEIVED IN CONNECTION WITH THIS
SOLICITATION

Firm
Name: E.l Computer Systems, Inc dba Continental Computers / WLANmall

Signature: U

Name and titlé érint or Type): &/}Z/éf A‘{Ed_( ;%’ff /ﬂ/é/f / )

Date: Q’/?’ /?
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Please list any clarifications of your bid in this section, as well as any exceptions you may
have. If there are none, indicate “N/A” on this sheet and submit with Bid. Please note, that
if clarifications or exceptions are listed, the Town may, at its sole discretion, accept or not
accept the entire bid as responsive and responsible.

The spec'd Q6155-E camera has been discontinued by Axis. Its replacement, the Q6155-E MK Il has not yet been released and pricing is not yet
availlable for it. If we are awarded the project, we not not be able to furnish the Q6155-E if it is no longer available. A change order may be needed for
the Q6155-E MK Il if there is a difference in pricing.
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SWORN STATEMENT UNDER SECTION 287.133(3) (a). FLORIDA STATUTES.
ON PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES
(To be signed in the presence of a notary public or other officer authorized to
administer oaths.)

Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared , who, being by
me first duly sworn, made the following statements;
1. The business address of _£7-/- Lot z‘w»]%'/ 5’&/5/(4»1:( Aac //sz ﬁn'/nm{’a/ &‘“%"74’&
[I{ame of olferor or CONTRACTOR)
s_ 220 M Nash st i/(z/’éf‘ b £z~ Seqbndo L7 F02ys

2. My relationship to ‘E/(}&lj-‘w’ 53 f};’ ‘/fmf /ac;. Abi 4”’%5’:{7@[”&“\/“‘%‘”“
(Narfie of offeror or CONTRACTOR)
is__ Lyesiteny or Be comfany . .
(Relationship such as sofe prc(prietor, partner, president, vice president, etc.)
3.l understand that a public entity crime as defined in Section 287.133 of the Florida Statutes
includes a violation of any state or federal law by a person with respect to and directly
related to the transaction of business with any public entity in Florida or with an agency
or political subdivision of any other state or with the United States, including, but not
limited to, any bid or contract for goods or services to be provided to any public entity or
such an agency or political subdivision and involving antitrust, fraud, theft, bribery,
collusion, racketeering, conspiracy, or material misrepresentation.

4. I understand that “convicted” or “conviction” is defined by the statute to mean a finding of
guilt or a conviction of a public entity crime, with or without an adjudication of guilt, in
any federal or state trail court of record relating to charges brought by indictment or
information after July 1, 1989, as a result of a jury verdict, nonjury trial, or entry of a plea
of guilty or nolo contendere,

5. I understand that "affiliate” is defined by the statute to mean (1) a predecessor or
successor of a person or a corporation convicted of a public entity crime, or (2) an entity
under the control of any natural person who is active in the management of the entity and
who has been convicted of a public entity crime, or (3) those officers, directors, executives,
partners, shareholders, employees, members, and agents who are active in the
management of an affiliate, or (4) a person or corporation who knowingly entered into a
joint venture with a person who has been convicted of a public entity crime in Florida
during the preceding 36 months.

6. Neither the Offeror or CONTRACTOR nor any officer, director, executive, partner,
shareholder, employee, member or agent who is active in the management of the Offeror
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or CONTRACTOR nor any affiliate of the Offeror or CONTRACTOR has been convicted of a

i public entity crime subsequent to July 1, 1989, 3 J /0
: 74

//' -
SlgnaLuYe / F{/Le (undersigned authority)

Sworn to and subscribed before me in the
State of 4 and
County of. Los Anaeles

onthe |7 day of. ScPkW,ZO_'?.

(Affix seal)

Notary Public
My commission expires: &x/1) [20% >

BRYAN CORRADO E
Notary Public -~ California 2

Los Angeies County =
Commission # 2223090

My Comm Expires Feb 17, 2022 F

A T T RO T e,
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STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF PALM BEACH

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally appeared L2/ £ rﬁ{d&&f—’
who, after being by me first duly sworn, deposes and says:

(1) Tlam Pfe,waf eu,f Of("°f7/lf:L/:’:{ é’*}“?{’/‘.'the offeror that has submitted a bid to
perform work for the following project:

Contract #_4‘7‘2—' Zf/_{ ;q Project name: Juyehnse pr Luv W?//f”‘ “ L ‘éﬁm eres

(2) I, the undersigned, hereby depose and say that no portion of the sum bid in
connection with the work to be performed at the property identified above will be paid to
any employee of the TOWN of Lake Park as a commission, kickback, reward or gift, directly
or indirectly by me or any member of my firm or by an officer of the corporation.

/}' fgnature

Subscribed and sworn to (or affirmed) before me this {7 day of Seg-.ltmbw 20 ﬁ

by Ezie [saac , who is personally known to me or who has

produced ¢4 Priver L/e€ns€ s identification,

NOTARY SEAL: Notary Signature: 1’%
R

BRYAN CORRADO
Nolary Pubfic - California 2 ) a o 7
o Angeies Counly Notary Name: Ryan : 2A LD
Commission # 2229090 N otary Public-State of es
My Comm Expires ©eb 17. 2022

AT
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NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

STATEOF (A~

COUNTY OF _¢ys dy-c/r;’c

Before me, the undersigned authority, personally appeared fui /):zm.‘, who after being
by me first duly sworn, deposes and says of his/her personal knowledge that:

a.

HefShe is £=r & fonac ofley e af 4o ferithe bidder that has submitted a
bid to perform work for the following; J -

ITB No.: _/09- 20/ Title: /)/‘ﬂﬂﬁda-,/’

He/She is fully informed respecting the preparation and contents of the attached
Invitation to Bid, and of all pertinent circumstances respecting such Solicitation.
Such bid is genuine and is not a collusive or sham Proposal.

Neither the said bidder nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents,
representatives, employees, or parties in interest, including this affiant, has in any
way colluded, conspired, connived, or agreed, directly or indirectly, with any other
bidder, firm or person to submit a collusive or sham bid in connection with the
Solicitation and contract for which the attached bid has been submitted or to refrain
from proposing in connection with such Solicitation and contract, or has in any
manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion or communication
or conference with any other Bidder, firm, or person to fix the price or prices in the
attached bid or any other Bidder, or to fix any overhead, profit or cost element of the
Bid price or the bid price of any other Bidder, ar to secure through any collusion,
conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement any advantage against the Town or
any person interested in the proposed contract.

The price or prices quoted in the attached bid are fair and proper and are not tainted
by any collusion, conspiracy, connivance, or unlawful agreement on the part of the
Bidder or any of its agents, representatives, owners, employees, oy parties in interest,

including this affiant, ]
—_—
(/Y

Signature

Subscribed and sworn to (or affirmed) before me this _{7_ day of_Sqe]gubL 2003 by

Ezie Isanc , who is personally knowh to me or who has produced
CA Driver Liethse , as identification,
SEAL Notary Signature
Notary Name: _££»s~ oRRA00
2 Notary Public (State): __¢4
RYAN CORRADO issi . 727 90
No?ary public - Califorria 5 My FIommlsslon N@ 02 ¥ Z2z 9090
Los Angeles County Expires on: '7/22

Commission # 2929090 j
by Comm. Expires Fel 17,2022
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EXRIRT B

Lake Park/PBSO Camera Project - Ancillary Costs

Camera Item(s) Cost

#1 |Wire/Conduit/Nema Box to house equipment $500.00
#2  |Assorted build supplies $100.00
Streetlight Power Adapter $100.00

#3  |FPL Power Installation $800.00
#4  |Streetlight Power Adapter $100.00
#5  |Streetlight Power Adapter $100.00
#6 | Wire/Conduit/Nema Box/Battery/Charger to house equipment $700.00
Power to be connected by electrical contractor $800.00

#7  |Wire/Conduit/Nema Box to house equipment $500.00
Power to be connected by electrical contractor $800.00

#8 |FPL Power Installation $800.00
#9  |Streetlight Power Adapter $100.00
#10 |Streetlight Power Adapter $100.00
#11 |FPL Power Installation $800.00
TOTAL| $6,300.00

10% contingency $630.00

GRAND TOTAL: $6,930.00



PURCHASE OF SURVEILLANCE CAMERAS AND RELATED EQUIPMENT

ITB No. 109-2018

BID TAB SHEET

EXTENDED BID PRICING
E.L. Computer
ITEM Systems, Inc. AVI Integrators Inc Adorama Inc.
NO. IMEM DESCRIGION QUANSLLY dba Continental dba Security 101 | (UNRESPONSIVE)
Computers
! PowerEdge R740xd (as specified in technical
specifications) 1 $9,650.00 $16,006.77 No Bid
) Q6155-E Camera, High-Speed PTZ with
Instant Laser Focus 11 $27,095.53 $29,284.20 $27,155.15
3 AXIS Electrical Safety Kit A 120VAC, 5503-
521 11 1685.53 $1,821.60 $1,689.49
4 |AXIS T91A57 Pole Mount, 60-400MM 11 $753.83 $815.10 $762.85
5 |AXIS T91L61 Wall-and-Pole Mount 11 $838.53 $906.18 $840.29
6 AXIS T98A18-VE Surveillance Cabinet, 5900+
181 11 $2,278.43 $2,462.46 $2,283.19
7 |AXIS Cabinet Lock 11 $499.73 $540.54 $501.05
8 |AXIS Surveillance Card 128GB 11 $877.03 $997.92 $925.65
9 |CradlePoint: NetCloud IoT 1yr IBR600C with 11 $6,326.10 $7,591.32 No Bid
10 XPROTECT CORPROATE DEVICE
LICENSE 22 $5,790.40 $5,940.00 No Bid
1 1 Year Support for XPCODL Device Channel
License 22 $1,056.00 $1,108.80 No Bid
TOTALS: $56,851.11 $67,474.89 $34,157.67

+5% Bid Bond $2,025.25
$69,499.14




